Request for Decision

City Council QS dﬁrﬁt&?

Type of Decision

Meeting Date October 24, 2002 Report Date October 16, 2002
Decision Requested X Yes No x | High Low
Direction Only Type of Meeting | x | Open Closed

Report Title
Contract 2002-53, Valley East Waste Water Treatment Plant, Clarifier & Ferric Tank Upgrades

Policy Implication + Budget Impact Recommendation
X This report and recommendation(s) have been reviewed by the

Finance Division and the funding source has been identified.

That Contract 2002-53, Valley East Waste Water
Treatment Plant, Clarifier & Ferric Tank Upgrades,
be awarded to Cecchetto & Sons Ltd., in the
tendered amount of $169,154.16, this being the
lowest tender meeting all contract specifications.

X | Background Attached Recommendation Continued

Recommended by the General Manager Recommended by the C.A.O.

Don Bélisle
General Manager of Public Works

Mark Mieto
Acting Chief Administigfi




Request for Decision

City Council

Recommendation continued

Background

Report Prepared By

/z. . J.Paul Graham, P. Eng.
Plants Engineer

Division Review

Tenders for Contract 2002-53, Valley East Waste Water Treatment Plant, Clarifier & Ferric Tank
Upgrades were opened at the Tender Opening Committee meeting at 2:30 p.m., local time, Tuesday,

October 15, 2002, as follows:

Cecchetto & Sons Ltd. 169,154.16
R. M. Belanger Limited 217,745.00
Copper Cliff Mechanical & Steel Fabricating 220,738.86
(1994) Limited

Tesc Contracting Company Ltd. 231,863.39
Nor Eng Construction & Engineering Inc. 234,330.00

All tenders have been reviewed and found to be in order.

The lowest tender meeting all contract specifications was submitted by Cecchetto & Sons Ltd. in the
tendered amount of $169,154.16, this being the lowest tender meeting all contract specifications and is

recommended for approval.

The Engineer’s estimate for this tender is $242,890.00 and this work is funded from the approved 2001

and 2002 Waste Water Envelope.




Request for Decision Greater | Grand
City Council ¥) Sudbiiry

www.city.greatersudbury.on.ca

Type of Decision

Meeting Date October 24, 2002 Report Date October 16, 2002
Decision Requested X Yes No Priority x | High Low
Direction Only Type of x | Open Closed

Report Title

Award of Tender
Rental of Operated Bulldozers/Loader for Snow Dump Operations 2002 - 2005

This report and recommedation(s) have been reviewed by the
Finance Division and the funding source has been identified.

That the tender for the Rental of Bulldozer/Loader
for Snow Dump Operations be awarded to O.C L.
Trucking & Excavating Ltd., this being the lowest

tender meeting all specifications.

x | Background Attached Recommendation Continued

Recommended by the General Manager

e

D. Bélisle
General Manager of Public Works Acting Chief Administig

Recommended by the C.A.O.




Request for Decision Greater | Grand
City Council * Sudbury

www.dity.greatersudbury.on.ca

Recommendation continued x | Background

Please indicate if the information below is a continuation of the Recommendation or Background

Report Prepared By

Division Review

/W /éﬁ%i -\
Madrice Montpellier

Director of Operations

Manager of Fleet

Tenders for the Rental of Bulldozer/Loader for Snow Dump Operations were opened at the Tender Opening
Committee meeting of October 8, 2002. The contract is for the supply and operation of a bulldozer and a
loader to push snow at the Snow Dump. The contractor must also bid a rate for a larger bulldozer to be
available upon request for periods of high volume. The estimated total value is $240,000.00. The tender is
for a three (3) year period and the tender results are as f ollows:

BIDDER Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate
1 Bulldozer 1 Large Bulldozer 1 Loader
O.C.L. Trucking & Excavating Ltd. $65.00 $95.00 $68.00
Ethier Sand & Gravel Limited $85.00 — $85.00
Pioneer Construction Inc. $125.00 $120.00 $100.00
Denis Gratton Transport Ltd. $69.00 $135.00 $69.00
William Day Construction Ltd. $118.00 — $120.00
Tate’s — — $125.00

The tenders have been reviewed and all found to be in order.
Award is recommended to the lowest bidder, O.C.L. Trucking & Excavating Ltd.

Funding for this work is provided from the current operating budgets for winter control on municipal roads.




Request for Decision

City Council 6 Sudb@rﬁeﬂrcrsn;

Type of Decision

Meeting Date | October 24™, 2002 Report Date October 16", 2002

Decision Requested X Yes Priority X | High

Direction Only X | Open Closed

Report Title

Award of Tender for Provision of Handi-Transit Services in the City of Greater Sudbury

Policy Implication + Budget Impact Recommendation
This report and recommendation(s) have been reviewed by the

Finance Division and the funding source has been identified.

THAT the contract for delivery of Handi-Transit
services in the City of Greater Sudbury be
awarded to Leuschen Bros. Limited, this being the
lowest price and highest scoring bid that meets the
criteria outlined in the RFP. The tender price is
$1,287,195.75 plus applicable taxes for the period
May 5", 2003, to May 4", 2008, with an option to
extend the contract on a yearly basis for a period
of an additional four (4) years.

Background Attached Recommendation Continued

Recomm.er ded by the General Manager Recommended by the C.A.O.




Title: Award of Tender for Provision of Handi-Transit Services in the City of Greater Sudbury Page 2
Date: October 16™, 2002

VA ! NS

Robert Johnston Robert Johnston
Director of Transportation Services Director of Transportation Services

Requests for Proposals (RFP’s) for the City of Greater Sudbury Handi-Transit service closed
Tuesday, September 17", 2002. The RFP represents the final phase of harmonizing the Handi-
Transit service within the City of Greater Sudbury, essentially providing the service provider(s)
the ability to transport clients across previous municipal boundaries using a central dispatch
service for the entire system. :

The proposal was structured in a manner that enabled proponents to bid on the entire contract or
separately on any of the service areas identified below, as well as the central dispatch service.
This provided fairness and equity to the proposal process by providing flexible bidding options to
those interested, especially the smaller companies. All prospective bidders were pre-qualified,
and only those meeting the qualifications were provided a Request For Proposal package.

Service Area A - defined to be the geographic boundaries of the City of Sudbury and the Town of
Nickel Centre prior to amalgamation into the City of Greater Sudbury.

Service Area B - defined to be the geographic boundaries of the City of Valley East and the
Town of Capreol prior to amalgamation into the City of Greater Sudbury.

Service Area C - defined to be the geographic boundaries of the Town of Walden prior to
amalgamation into the City of Greater Sudbury.

Service Area D - defined to be the geographic boundaries of the Town of Rayside-Balfour & the
Town of Onaping Falls prior to amalgamation into the City of Greater Sudbury.

Central Dispatch - provide scheduling & dispatch service for the entire system.

A mandatory Proposal Information Meeting was held in August prior to the RFP to ensure all
proponents were properly briefed on the proposal process. In addition to disseminating
information, this meeting also provided an opportunity for proposers to ask questions concerning
the contract documents.

A set of Evaluation Criteria and an Evaluation Committee was set out in the RFP document as
the means of evaluating and awarding the contract to the successful bidder(s).




Title: Award of Tender for Provision of Handi-Transit Services in the City of Greater Sudbury

Date: October 16", 2002

Evaluation Criteria

Price
Experience

50%
20%

Customer Relations 20%

Scheduling

10%

Evaluation Committee

Darryl Mathe, Manager of Supplies & Services
Bob Johnston, Director of Transportation Services
Roger Sauvé, Greater Sudbury Transit Manager
Robert Gauthier, Supervisor of Transit Operations

Evaluation of Proposals

Page 3

The table below illustrates the bids received for each service area and the central dispatch

service.
Leuschen Bros. Bill Martin’s Northway Bus First Bus Canada
Limited Bus Lines Lines Inc. Limited
Service Area A $772,990.75 No Bid No Bid $1,158,430.00
Service Area B $161,475.00 No Bid $187,349 $247,900.00
Service Area C $110,980.00 $167,999 No Bid $160,800.00
Service Area D $79,750.00 No Bid No Bid $120,600.00
Central Dispatch $162,000.00 No Bid No Bid $214,500.00

Total Bid

$1,287,195.75

$1,902,230.00

As illustrated above, the prices submitted by Leuschen Bros. Limited were substantially lower
than all other bids for each service area and the dispatch service. Their total evaluation score
based on the evaluating criteria set out in the RFP was 97 percent, again significantly greater

than any of the competing proposals.

Leuschen Bros. Limited (formerly Estaire Bus Lines) have had a long history of providing
exemplary Handi-Transit service to citizens of the City of Sudbury and Nickel Centre prior to
amalgamation, and continue to provide this service today to the same geographic area of the
City of Greater Sudbury. They are fully capable of expanding their role and assuming the full

scope of the contract to the entire City of Greater Sudbury.

Although the proposal provided for the possibility of multiple service providers, there are obvious
benefits to having one service provider for the entire City of Greater Sudbury. The consistency of

?




Title: Award of Tender for Provision of Handi-Transit Services in the City of Greater Sudbury Page 4
" Date: October 16™, 2002

service, ease of collecting and reconciling fares, more efficient deployment of vehicles and co-
ordination of customer pick-ups, as well as a more streamlined contract administration with
respect to paying invoices and responding to customer complaints, are a few of these benefits.

The overall budget for the Handi-Transit service in 2002 was $1,373,000. It should be noted that
the Leuschen Bros. Limited proposal price in the amount of $1,287,195.75 is well within budget.

It is recommended that the Handi-Transit contract be awarded to Leuschen Bros. Limited in the
amount of $1,287,195.75 plus applicable taxes, for the period May 5, 2003, to May 4, 2008, with
an option to extend the contract on a yearly basis for a period of an additional four (4) years.




Reguest for Decisic:n (\ Greater |Grand
City Council +) Su Ury

www.city.greatersudbury.

Type of Decision

Meeting Date October 24, 2002 ‘ Report Date October 10, 2002
Decision Requested X Yes No Priority x | High Low
Direction Only Type of Meeting x | Open Closed

Report Title
Disposal of Surplus Fill, Contract 2002-23- MR 80 Upgrading - Yvon Despatie

This report and recommendation(s) have been reviewed by the
Finance Division and the funding source has been identified.

n/a

That due to a lack of suitable land available for
disposal of excavated material for contract 2002-
23 (MR 80 Upgrading), that disposal take place on
Part of Lot 2, Concession 1, designated as Part 1 -
53R-12520, Parcel 49039 S.E.S., Hanmer
Township, City of Greater Sudbury, owned by
Yvon Despatie.

X | Background Attached Recommendation Continued

Recommended by the General Manager Recommended by the C.A.O.

D. Bélisle %é//

General Manager of Public Works Acting Chief AdNinisthgtive Officer




Request for Decision

City Council QSUdBﬁrfmi;

www.dity.greatersudbury.on.ca

Recommendation continued x | Background

Eleéée indicate if the information below is a continuation of the Racommehdation or Badkg‘round

Report Prepared By

250

Kevin J. Shaw, P. Eng.
Manager of Construction Services

Division Review

e dv—

> P. Eng.
Acting Director of Engineering Services

Regional Policy previously established by the Public Works Committee, required that surplus
material from construction projects be disposed of on public property with the exception that
property owners providing easements may obtain the material from the easement.

Resolution 83-113 of the Engineering Committee and the report dated August 30, 1983, outline
the policy (see attached).

The City of Greater Sudbury has provided a location at the Valley East Gravel Pit and we feel as
such, that alternate locations may be required to receive excess fill.

A request has been received from Yvon Despatie, who has land suitable for such disposal on
Dominion Drive. The property is described as Part of Lot 2, Concession 1, designated as Part 1 -
53R-12520, Parcel 49039 S.E.S., City of Greater Sudbury, as shown on the attached plan.

/b




@ Sudbiiiy

www.city.greatersudbury.on.ca

LETTER OF CONSENT

Ocr o 002

This is to confirm that the City of Greater Sudbury and its contractors have my authority

to enter and dump excess excavated material from Contract ol 992 ~A3 - Hwy 67

NU&TH{M/( 50) ’WDCIL'&Di.«'G - BAvEA vt 70 300m NoF FRos7onto my property known as F// oF LeT 2

Cow | DESGuaren AS _fr 1 $9R -12520  fee #9939 3E5 Township of Havmek

Cire of 6IEMEL Swpbul?.

It is understood that levelling of the fill will be my responsibility. | will direct the City
and/or its contractors where to place the material and will ensure that any flood plain

land is not filled and that any drainage courses are not obstructed.

?/0 _Ocrelfox %m@m%

(Wltn ignature of Owng#)”

Viow Despars'e

Name of Owner (please print)

G:\engnKEVIN\letter of consent.wpd
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www.city. greatersudbury on.ca

roffice Correspondence

Date: S’Ef"' /07//0*

TO: Al Bonis
FROM: K. Shaw
RE: Inquiry on Flood Plain

- -
We have received a request to provide fill material on f [ oF LoT Cow /

ISsionaTEd As 7. 1 SOF - 11590 fer %9039 ses
,'/ANI"\M {\N[D‘ /LE/\SE SEE AT AchEd SKETCH. [//Jﬂv -ﬁ”f’ui?ﬂ}

KJ. shawl/
Manager, Construction Services

Please indicate if this property is situated in flood plain:

YES NO X

Additional Remarks:

Dated: Sg,ﬂ . Z 3’ 2#2  Signature:

G:\engr\KEVIN\inquiry on flood plain.wpd
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keport dated August 30, 1983 was received froad

Policy - Disposal A

of Surplus the Regional Engineer regarding policy for the

Excavated Material disposal of surpius excavated material from

Regional Regional construction projects. )

Construction ] .

Projects o 83-113 peck-Hayduk: That the present policy
lus excavacted

respecting the disposal of surp
material from Regional construc

reconfirmed:

tion projects te

1. That the material be placed on putlic
properties only, except for work carried out on

easements.

2. For work carried out on easements the
surplus material generated from the easement ¢can
be left on the abutting property.

Policy - Disposal - 3. If suitable public property is not available

of Surplus ) for disposal of surplus material, alternate
Excgvated Material arrangements be approved‘by the Enginéering
Regional Committee for dispsosal of material. :
Construction '

Projects (Cont'd) CARRIED




gional SESNRT
of Scpumicipality

Fom P.J. Morrow, P.Eng., Regional Engineer Cate Aygust 30, 1983

® For Action g Fer information Fle Na

a #hniq;Cbﬂninee O Sucbuy Regional Cevelopment Com

@ Engineering Commnittee . 0 France Committee

O Health and Social Senices Committee  (J PAC

O Committee of the Whole - O Coucd O Other
Subject

Disposal of surplus excavated material from Regional construction
projects.

Recd%nmndmxn

That the present policy respecting the disposal of surplus excavated
material from Regional construction projects be re-confirmed:

l. That the material be placed on public properties only, except
for work carried out on easements.

2. For work carried out on easements the surplus material gene-
rated from the easement can be left on the abutting property.

3. If suitable public property is not available for disposal of

surplus material, alternate arrangements be approved by the
Engineering Committee for disposal of the material.

RECOMMEMDED FOR APFRCVAL

SIGNATURE ) P.J. Morrow, P.Eng.
' ' Regional Engineer

Background

The matter of disposal of surplus excavated material from Regional
construction projects was requested to be brought back to the
Committee for examination. This.matter has been to the Committee

on several occasions in the past.

i5 ... 2.
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Engineering Committee
Re: Disposal of surplus excavated material
August 30, 1983

Backaground - continued

Resolutions 82-15 and 74-28 of the Committee and reports dated
January 28, 1982 and February 6, 1974 outline the policy. The
policy requires that surplus material be disposed of on public
property with the exception that property owners providing
easements may obtain material from the easement. If, however,
we do not have a public’ property suitable for disposal within
a- reasonable haul distance from the construction site, the
matter is to be referred to the Engineering Committee.

Such has been the case for the 1983 ALgonquiﬁ Road project and
the Vermilion Lake Road project. -

We are still of the opinion ghat surplus material should go .to
public properties, Or lands abutting an easement and that dis-
posal should not become the responsibility of the contractors.
If left in the hands of the contractors disposal could be
carried out on individual properties in the construction area
and unsightly areas could develop where the materialis dumped.
When the public property 1is unavailable, other arrangements
woirld' only be carried out with the concurrence of your Commit-
tee. The preferred alternate arrangement is disposal on large
parcels of private property such as has been agreed to for the
Algonguin Road and Vermilion Lake Road Projects.

Attachments

16
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Request for Decision

City Council 6 Sudﬁimiﬂlgm)n;

www.city.greatersudbury.on.ca

Type of Decision

Meeting Date | October 24, 2002 Report Date
Decision Requested X Yes No Priority X | High Low
Direction Only Type of X | Open Closed

Report Title

The Cancellation, Reduction or Refund of Realty Taxes -
Sections 442, 442 and 443 of The Municipal Act

This report and recommendation(s) have been reviewed by the
Finance Division and the funding source has been identified.

N/A ' That City Council authorize the cancellation,
reduction or refund of Realty Taxes pursuant to
Sections 441, 442 and 443 of The Municipal Act, in
accordance with the Report from the General
Manager of Corporate Services / Acting General
Manager of Emergency Services dated October 15,
2002.

X | Background Attached Recommendation Continued

Recommended by the General Manager Recommended by the C.A.O.

; & M. Mieto
General Manager of Corporate Services / Acting Chief AdmirdstratiYe Officer
Acting General Manager of Emergency Services

/1




Title: The Cancellation, Reduction or Refund of Realty Taxes - Page 2
Sections 442, 442 and 443 of The Municipal Act

Reviewed By: Mary Lynn Gauvreau, Manager of Current Accounting Operations

Date: October 15, 2002

Report Prepared By Division Review

Qg

T. Derro S. Jonasson
Supervisor of Tax / Chief Tax Collector Director of Finance / City Treasurer

Sections 441, 442 and 443 of The Municipal Act provide the authority for the cancellation, reduction or refund
of realty taxes.

Section 441:

Section 441 authorizes the cancellation of realty taxes deemed by the Treasurer to be
uncollectable. This may include, but is not limited to, taxes resulting from wrongful assessment,
properties obtaining exemption status, property acquisitions by the municipality, or realty taxes that
exceed the value of the land. The Council of the Municipality may direct the Treasurer to remove
such uncollectable taxes from the Collector’s Roll.

Section 442:

Section 442 authorizes the cancellation, reduction or refund of realty taxes in the current year for
such reasons as change in rate of taxation, change in tax status, fire/demolition or gross error.

Section 442 applications are verified by the Municipal Property Assessment Corporation and
processed by the municipality.

Section 443:

Section 443 authorizes the reduction of realty taxes for clerical errors such as errors in
keypunching, transposition of figures or mathematical calculations. Such errors occur with the
preparation of the assessment roll and are confirmed by the Municipal Property Assessment
Corporation prior to the tax adjustment by the municipality. Section 443 applications apply to the
two (2) taxation years prior to the year in which the error(s) was made.

The Treasurer's recommendations for the cancellation, reduction or refund of realty taxes under The
Municipal Act is presented to Council for approval.

Attached for Council’s information and action is Schedule “A” summarizing the tax adjustments by authority,
reason and amount. Also attached is Schedule “B” which provides a more detailed property-by-property
description of the tax adjustments.

Council should be aware that upcoming changes to The Municipal Act in 2003 may alter this process,
however, Council will be kept apprised of any new developments in this regard.

/&




SCHEDULE A’

ADJUSTMENT OF TAXES
UNDER SECTION 442 OF THE MUNICIPAL ACT

Reason for Adjustment Applications Amount of Taxes
Fire / Demolition 24 $19,445.02
Became Exempt 10 $40,845.02
Reduced Assessment 1 $1,193.69
Gross of Manifest Clerical Error 10 $7,186.97
Change in Tax Class Rate 32 $52,177.09
Uncollectible Taxes 5 $1,334.22
TOTAL: 82 $122,182.01

Sharing Ratio City Education Total

68.93% 31.07% 100.00%
$84,219.92 $37,962.09 $122,182.01

/9
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